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Outboard Spark Plug Wires
REQUIRED Spark Plug Wire Replacement on the
following Mariner, Mercury and Sea Ray Outboard
Motors.

Models - U.S.A. Serial Number Range

Merc 35 0B189362 thru 0B370059

Merc/Mariner 45 0B189362 thru 0B370059

Merc/Mariner 50/60 0B196994 thru 0B371117

Merc/Mariner 70-100 0B194529 thru 0B373335

Sea Ray 90 & 100 0B252221 thru 0B376704

Merc/Mariner 115 0B196994 thru 0B371171

Performance 44XS 0B135496 thru 0B290444

Models - Belgium Serial Number Range

Merc 35 9475100 thru 9542619

Merc/Mariner 45 9475100 thru 9542619

Merc/Mariner 50/60 9480490 thru 9542619

Merc/Mariner 70-90 9483055 thru 9541985

Merc/Mariner 100 9483055 thru 9542618

Models - Canada Serial Number Range

Merc 35 A723004 thru A742199

Merc/Mariner 45 A723004 thru A742048

Merc/Mariner 50/60 A723004 thru A741208

Merc/Mariner 70-100 A723004 thru A741083

Mercury Marine has determined that the spark plug
wires on some Mariner, Mercury and Sea Ray Out-
boards (model numbers and serial numbers speci-
fied above) must be replaced to reduce the possibility
of premature insulation breakdown, potential electri-
cal arcing.

1. Owners of these outboards, who are properly
registered with Mercury Marine (Warranty Regis-
tration Card), will receive a letter and a “Cam-
paign Claim” card as notification of the RE-
QUIRED spark plug wire replacement. (A copy of
the letter is printed on this bulletin). They will also

receive, under separate cover, replacement
spark plug wires. The letter instructs the owner to
immediately contact their dealer and schedule
replacement of the spark plug wires.

Credit for 0.5 hour labor per 35 HP outboard and
1.0 hour labor per larger outboard, will be issued
upon return of the completed “Campaign Claim”
card to your Regional Service Center, thus a war-
ranty claim is not required for registered out-
boards.

2. Outboards in your inventory:

Order a spark plug wire kit from your Regional
Distribution Center for each outboard (within the
above model number and serial number range)
that you have in stock. Part numbers for the vari-
ous spark plug wire kits are as follows:

Models
Part Number of Spark

Wire Plug Kit

Merc/Mariner 6, 8, 9.9 & 15 84-813715A2

Merc/Mariner 20, 25 84-813715A3

Merc 35 84-813715A4

Merc/Mariner 45 84-813715A5

Merc/Mariner 50, 60 84-813715A6

Merc/Mariner 70, 75, 80, 90 84-813715A7

Merc/Mariner 100 84-813715A8

Merc/Mariner 90, 115 (6 cyl.) 84-813715A10

Merc/Mariner V-6 Models 84-813715A9

Do complete a warranty claim for units in your
stock. More than one unit can be listed on a war-
ranty claim, however, it is essential that all serial
numbers are listed.

3. Replacement spark plug wire kits P/N
84-99215A25 and 84-99215A26 in your inven-
tory: Fill out a warranty claim and send the claim
and the spark plug wire kits to your Regional Ser-
vice Center for warranty reimbursement.


